10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

IR l\|!\1\!I1ILIl||I|\lHII|

21-94 Introduce: 8-9-2021

ORDINANCE NO. <1il6

AN ORDINANCE amending Lincoln Municipal Code Chapter 19.03, Fire Code,
to adopt the provisions of the 2018 edition of the International Fire Code.

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Lincoln, Nebraska:

Section 1. That Section 19.03.010 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.010 Code Adopted.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations., governing conditions hazardous to life and

property from fire and explosion, there is hereby adopted the "International Fire Code (IFC),"

20182 Edition, and all appendices. save and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted,

modified, or amended.
Section 2. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.022 to read as follows:

19.03.022 Section M102.1 Exception Added: (Appendix *M”) Hioh-Rise Buildings.

Exception {5) to Scction M102.1 of the International Fire Code is added 1o read as follows:

Exception 5. Where the fire code official determines that alternative svstems. methods of

construction, materials. or designs are deemed acceptable, the required automatic sprinkler system

shall not be required.

Section 3. That Section 19.03.030 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.030 Section 103.1 Amended; Organization of the Bureau of Fire Prevention.

Section 103.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:



10

11

12

13

14

15

17

18

20

21

22

23

103.1 Organization of the bBureau of fFire pPrevention. The bBureau of fFire

pPrevention (“the Bureau”) is established within the City of Lincoln. dDepartment of Building

and sSafety under the direction of the firc code official. The bBureau shall consist of such
personnel, as-ay-be assigned thereto by the dDirector of Bbuilding and sSafety, who is hereby

designated as the fire code official as defined in the International Fire Code. Section 202-ef-this

eode. The function of theis bBureau shall be to assist the fire code official in the administration
and enforcement of the fire prevention provisions of this code. The Bbureau, ef-fire-prevertion

with the assistance of the City of Lincoln Fire and #Rescue dDepartment (LFR), shall provide

cducation and training to schools, hospitals, public and private organizations, and institutions on
fire preventionprecaution practices and evacuation procedures. The-bureaw-of fire preventionshall

q 1y ities.
Section 4. That Section 19.03.040 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to

read as follows:

19.03.040 Sections 103.4.2 Added; Fire Suppression Systems303:2;- 1033, 103.4,-103.4:1:

Deleted.

Sections 103.4.2 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:

103.4.2 Fire Suppression Systems. The fire code official. a member of the board of

appeals. an officer or an emplovee shall not be liable in any manner for any change, alteration, or

addition recommended or ordered to any fire suppression syslem, nor {or the approval ol any plan

or specification. or the designation ol anv paltern or type of valve. accessories, or appliances to

anv fire suppression system: nor shall the ordering or recommmending of any alteration or addition

to any fire suppression system be construed as a puarantee of the sutficiency thereof” nor shall the

issuance of any permit be construed as a suarantee of the sufficiency thereof’ nor shall the issuance




10

11

12

13

i4

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

of any permit be construed as a puarantee of the sufficiency of the water supply for any such fire

suppression system in any building or upon any premises: nor shall the City of Lincoln or the water

svslem be liable for the fatlure to provide sufficient pressure or sufficient water supply to any fire

suppression svstem: and every permil issued by the city shall be conditioncd upon this section

which is hereby made a part of each permit issued for all fire suppression systems . $93-2303-3;

Section 5. That Section 19.03.050 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.050 Section 104.10 Amended; Fire Investigations.

Section 104.10 of the Intemational Fire Code 15 amended to read as follows:

104.10 Fire investigations. The fire code official bureawoffire-prevention shall have the

authority to investigate the eanses-origin, cause, and circumstances of any fire, explosion or other

hazardous condition. Information that could be related to trade secrets of processes shall not be

made part of the public record except as directed by a court of law.

Section 6. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by

adding a new section numbered 19.03.052 to read as follows:



10

11

12

13

14

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

19.03.052 Section 104.10.1 Amended; Assistance from Other Agencies.

Secction 104,10.1 of the International Fire Code 1s amended to read as follows:

104.10.1 Assistance from other agencies. Whenever requested to do so by the fire code official.

or an authorized representative. the Lincoln Police Department (LPD) shall assiegn such available

police officers at the LPD’s discretion to assist the fire code official in enforcing the provisions of

this code. In addition. the fire code official may request members to be detailed tfrom LFR as

necessary.
Section 7. That Section 19.03.060 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to

read as follows:

19.03.060 Section 104.11 Amended; Authority at Fires and Other Emergencies.

Section 104.11 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

104.11 Authority at fires and other emergencies. The [ire code official and the-fire-and
rescue-departmentLI'R shall have the power and authority at the scene of a fire or other emergency
involving the protection of life or property to direct such operation as—ay—be necessary to
extinguish or control any fire, perform any rescue operation, investigate the existence of suspected

or reported fires, gas leaks, or other hazardous conditions or situations or of taking any other action

necessary in the reasonable performance of-their duty. FThe-fire-and resene-departmentL 'R shall
maintain control at the fire scene until the-firecommand has been extinguished-and-the bureavof
fire-prevention-has—arrived-at-the-scene _relinquished to the fire code official. In the exercise of

such power, the fire code official or fire-and-rescue-departmentLFR may prohibit any person,

vehicle, vessel or thing from approaching the scene, and is authorized tomay remove, or cause to

be removed or kept away from the scene, any vehicle, vessel, or thing which may impede or

interfere with the operations of the fire code official or LFR-andreseue-department-orbureauof




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

firepreventien in the extinguishment or investigation of such fire or emergency and, in the

judgment of the fire code official or LFRfire-andreseue-department, any person not actually and

usefully employed in the extinguishment or investigation of such fire or emergency or in the
preservation of property in the vicinity thereof.
Section 8. That Section 19.03.070 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.07¢0 Section 104.11.1 Amended; Autherity-at Kires-and- Other-Emergeneies;
Authority to Barricade.
Section 104.11.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:
104.11.1 Authority te barricade. The fire code official or LFRthe—fire—and—resecue
department or their authorized representative, who may be in charge at the scene of an emergency,
shall have the authority to place ropes, guards, barricades, or other obstructions across any street,

alley, place, or private property in the vicinity of such operation so as to prevent accident or

interference with the lawful efforts of the fire code official of L FR-bureav-offire prevention-orfire

and-reseve-departrent to manage and control the situation.
Section 9. That Section 19.03.080 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to

read as follows:

19.03.080 Section 104.11.2 Amended; Obstructing OperationsAuthority atEires—and

Section 104.11.2 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

104.11.2 Obstructing Operationsknterference. Amy—pPersons shall not whe-obstructs

the operations or disobey any lawtul command of the fire code official, LFR. or LPD-andreseue

department—orbureat-of fireprevention In connection with investigations. extinguishment or




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

18

19

20

21

22

control of any fire, or actions relative to other emergencies.investigatins-or-extingnishing any-fire;

Section 10. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by

adding a new section numbered 19.03.082 to read as follows:

19.03.082 Section 104.12 Added; False Statement.

Section 104.12 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:

104.12 False Statement. [t shall be unlawful for anv person to make a false statement,

known by such person to be {alse, 1o any lire code official concerning the subject of an inspection

or an investisation.

Section 11. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.084 to read as follows:

19.03.084 Section 105.1.1.1 Added; Owner’s Authorized Agent - Fire Suppression

Systems.

Section 105.1.1.1 of the Intemational Fire Code 1s added to read as follows:

105.1.1.1.1 {Overhead) Fire Suppression Systems. Sprinkler system permits shall only

be issued to currently licensed sprinkler system contractors, wel/dry chemical system permils shatl

only be issued to curtently licensed wet/dry chemical system contractors. and gas extinguishing

syslem perntits shatl only be issued lo currently licensed gas extinguishing system contractors. All

licensed fire suppression system contractors being issued a permit shali be registered under the

provisions of Section 114.3.1 of this code.




10

11

12

13

14

5

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

105.1.1.1.2 (Underground) Fire Suppression Svstems. Permits {or underground piping

shall only be issued to either a master plumber or a licensed fire suppression system contractor,

registered under the provisions of this code. All licensed fire suppression system contractors being

issued a permit shall be registered under the provisions of Section 114.3.1 of this code.

105.1.1.1.3 Work Performed Under a Different License. No licensed fire suppression

sysiem contraclor or journeyman shall allow their name 10 be used by another person. directly or

indirectly, etther to obtain a permit for the installation. repair. or alteration of any fire suppression

system or underground piping as hereinafier required. or perform anv firc suppression svstem

work. If any licensed {ire suppression system contractor or Journeyman violates this provision.

the tire code official may recommend revocation of their license issued to such person. In addition

to having their license revoked. such fire suppression system contractor or journeyman may be

prosecuted under the penalty section of this code.

Section 12. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.086 to read as follows:

19.03.086 Section 105.1.1.2 Added; Owner’s Authorized Agent - Tents and Other

Membrane Structures.

Section 105.1.1.2 of the International Fire Code 1s added to read as follows:

105.1.1.2 Owner’s Authorized Agent - Tents and Other Membrane Structures, The

company ot individual erecting the tent or membrane structure shall be responsible for obtaining

the permit.

Section 13. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.088 to read as follows:

19.03.088 Section 105.4.2.1 Amended; Fire Protection Svstem Shop Drawings.




\]

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

18

19

20

21

22

Section 105.4.2.1 of the International Fire Code is ainended to read as follows:

105.4.2.1 Fire Protection Svstem Shop Drawings, Shop drawings for the fire protection

system(s) shall be submitted to indicate compliance with this code and the construction documents

and shall be approved prior to the start of installation. Shop drawines shall contain all information

as required by the referenced installation standards in Chapter 9 of the International Fire Code.

Shop drawings and supporting data shall be submiited in three (3) sets along with the associated

pernnit application in such form and detail as required by the fire code official. Upon the granting

ol a permit. the Department of Building and Safety shall retain one (1) set of the city approved,

stamped shop drawings and supporting data and the applicant shall keep the remaining two (2) sets

of city approved, stamped shop drawings and supporting data; where one (1) set will be required

to be located at the site in which the work is being performed.

Exception I. Shop drawings and supporting data shall not be required when

modifications are made to an existing fire sprinkler svstem that involve adding or

relocating twenty (20) or less sprinkler heads. This exception does not alleviate the

reguirement for a permit application submission. including a permit fee as indicated in

Section 106.2 of this code, and an inspection conducted by the fire code official.

Exception 2. Shop drawings shall not be required for repairs that are made to existing

undereround pipina.  This exception does not alleviate the requirement for a permit

application submission, including a permil fee as indicated 1n Section 106.2 of this code,

and an inspection conducted by the fire code official.

Exception 3. Shop drawings shall not be required for new or the replacement of a

backtlow preventor device. This exception does not alleviate the requirement for a




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

permit application submission. including a permit fee as indicated in Seetion 106.2 of

this code. and an inspection conducted by the fire code official.

Exception 4. Shop drawings and supporting data shall not be required when

modifications arc made to an existing fire alarm syslem that invelve twenty (20) or less

device replacements. Relocatinge existing devices and/or adding new devices are not

covered under the scope of this exception. This exception does not alleviate the

requirement for a permil application submission. including a permit fee as indicated in

Section 106.2 of this code, and an inspection conducted by the fire code official.

Section 14. That Section 19.03.090 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.090 Section 105.4.7 Added; New Construction and Alterations.
Section 105.4.7 is-added-teof the International Fire Code 1s added to read as follows:

105.4.7 New construction and alterations. When construction documents and

supporting data. plans—and-specificatiens—required to be submitted by Section 1014864 of the

International Building Code (IBC). 2018 Edition. ase-for construction or work for which the

bBurecau er-approval is required, a separate i i
pp q P
plan review and-inspeetienfee-shall be paid to the bBureau-effireprevention. The plan review

fee will include the plan review conducted by the Bureau as well as the initial inspection completed

by the fire code official. Anv additional inspections. beyvond the initial inspection, will be subject

to additional fees set forth by Section 106.2 of this code.One-third-of the feeshall-be-paid-at-the




10

11

12

14

15

16

Section 15. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by

adding a new section numbered 19.03.092 to read as follows:

19.03.092  Section 105.4.8 Added; Schedule of Plan Review Fees.

Section 105.4.8 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:

105.4.8 Schedule of Plan Review Fees. The following shall be the plan review fees

charged as required by Section 105.4.7 of this code. Such fees shall be paid to the Department of

Building and Safety. No plan review fee shall be refunded after anv plan review has been

completed by the Bureauw. regardless it said application is withdrawn.

1. | Plan Review Fee

- Total value of the proposéd improvement $1.50 per $1.000
- Minimum 550.00

1~

Submitting Payvment

1/3 of the averall
plan review fee.
Remaining 2/3 of
- Upon issuance of the building permit. the plan review

To be paid at the time of the permit / plan submission.

fee.

Section 16, That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.094 to read as follows:

19.03.094 Sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.50 Deleted; Reguired Operational Permits.

10



10

11

12

Sections 105.6.1 through 103.6.50 of the International Fire Codce are hereby deleted.

Section 17. That Section 19.03.100 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to

read as follows:

19.03.100 Section 105.6.51 AddedAmended; Required Operational Permits—andPermit

Fees.
Section 105.6.51 of the International Fire Code is addedamended to read as follows:
105.6.51 Required Operational Permits-and-permit-fees.

——105:6-1 Permitrequired:The fire code official is authorized 1o issue operational permits
s-in the following

[tems indicated with an (*) shall be inspected annually and an operational permit must be obtained

each year to continue the activities, operations. practices. or functions.

1. i Carnivals. Fairs, Festivals

2. | * Explosives and Blasting Agents, (IFC Chapter 56)

3. | Firework Displays (IFC Chapter 56 and Lincoln Municipal Code (IL.MC) Chapter 9.44)

| 4. | Firework Stands (IFC Chapter 56.and LMC Chapter.9.44)
I

5. | Flammahle Combustible Liguids and Tanks (IFC Chapters 23 and 57)

6. | * Hazardous Materials in Excess of Permit Amounts.Listed in the [FC, Table 105.6.20.

Storage and Use Liquefied Petroleum Gas (1FC Chapter 61)

7.
8. | * Assembly (POA) (IFC Chapter 202}

9. | Pyrotechnic / Special Effect Material (IFC Chapter 56)

* Spraying or Dipping Operations Utilfzi_ng Flammable or Combustible Finishes (IFC Chapter
24)
11. + * Storage of Scrap Tires and Tire Bvproducts that Exceed 2.500 Cubic Feet (IFC Chapter 34)

L S -

Puath
&

11



10

11

12

12. | Temporary Membrane Structure. Tent or Canopy (IFC.Chapter 31)
124 Temporary Membrane Structure, Tents or Canopies with Assemblies with a Capacity of 50 or
=== | More Persons
13. | * Mobile. Food Preparation Vehicles (IFC Section 319)
14. | * Hotels and Motels
15. | * Fraternities and Sqrorities
‘ 16 Institutional Group [-4 (IFC Chapter 202)
- - Child Daycare and Adult Davcare Facilities
17. | * Schools {(L.MC Section 27.02.200)
18 * Health Carc Facilities (LMC Scetion 27.02.090) ‘r
— - Residential and Non-Residential ‘
19. | Liquor Establishments
20. | * Mobile Home Court (LMC Section 21.56.01(%)
21. | * High Rise Buildings (IFC Section 202)
* Institutional Group 1-3 (IFC Chapter 202)
22 - Including. but not limited to. Correctional Centers. Detention Centers, Prerelease

Centers, Jails. Prisons, and Reformatories.

12




10

—_—
—

12

13

14

[V
—

16

I~
—

18

178 00
T I THO Y s s s s s s e s rr e s s e e L O

e Aren]aay

19

180 00/
IO o

actond
Pl P N T e N I R R I O R o

20

<

000 T ata Faa aftar 610
[P I A FAv AT G ar) AR vy R AR v 2 N AT R

21

™~
(o]

23

13



12

13

14

15

lé

17

18

19

20

21

22

cafncoarablay
OO SCITIOTY

14



T Q5 00
ooy

Ot A0 ranmis

T T yerrcarramerrrmmirrremarrearasrronmarrrasasrronsrannar

AT a5 v

+-85-00

Nta AN racmac
RO T T OUTTIIY s isnantsnadatnaaaatonnasthasadtinsnatttaandatonasans

o

=

11

L1745 0@
IO oTrC Oty ot T YT L e

O1 e samen dayinac

12

13

< 2000
OO oY

1 4 2 ahaldean

Theencasraaet

Tt O o T

14

L]
—_

16

10000
P Toood

Sohaalc

163
VaYs

ArsemeeTreesrermmsrremairrrAnY

AT 8 L EA w4 T Uy T

17

L1725 00
[ == e

1 +a S0 hade

T PO N U T v ssandsansarvnnnaisnnatisnnaasibnaisnnasiistaatintoanaionminannna

18

19

<150 00

21+~ 100 hadas

o

e

[V e s T e w v v T T N e R T A PN T T ]

20

C178 0N

Ozag Lge_hcu‘l:-
oyor 1 oCd e e

21

o™~
o

15



01

1 ta S0 hads

T

Ot |

e e e s T T T T T I N T T T T R TN T

21 4t 10N hade
[0 QL SV SV AT e Wi = T T

L1850 00
oot

Theeaa

$100.00
- Ea~ar- s

O0-beads

AT "L~ = T BT

T 74 00

1 ta-530-bhads

LI~ A%

- F

I U U T s erran

(40 L Av e uu v L}\rua...............................-.......................................-...........$150.0@

21 o 100 hade

L1758 00
[ v

Ovar 100 hads
Y LT OO O

10

—
—

12

Lan}
—

14

<100 00
LA A

e teeesatencas

R aincnaction
TCITRY Ao TOT

15

16

~
—

18

19

20

21

22

23

i6



$40.00

rrrra e rdT oy

h'ﬂ;ﬂ;mllm

T

10

L34 00
pr=or

annandl narmit
CHIOIULY P\-vl..ll..ll.(' B YN PP YYINPPEYICPFYSIPPFENI FERUALI PP FPYTL PP YN I FANY S TFENIITONSNTFFPYIIFPYCT ATV IIFONYSIAITIASSTY

11

©~
—

13

=
™~

23

17



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Section 18. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by

adding a new section numbered 19.03.102 to read as follows:

19.03.1002 Table 105.6.20 Added; Permit Amounts for Hazardous Materials.

Table 105.6.20 of the International Fire Code is added to the provisions of this code.

Section 19. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.104 to read as follows:

19.03.104 Section 105.8 Added; Certificate of Insurance.

Section 105.8 of the lnternational Fire Code is added to read as follows:

105.8 Certificate of Insurance. Before any licensed (ire suppression system conlraclor

shall be issued. under the provisions of this code. such contractor shall be required to:

(a) At all times. maintain public liability insurance coverage for all claims arising oul of all

work in the City of Lincoln and within three (3) miles of the corporate limits thereof done

by or under the supervision of the licensed fire suppression system contractor under the

provisions of ihis code. Such insurance shall be in the form of a commercial or

comprehensive veneral liability policv. or an acceptable substitute policy form as permutied

by the City Attorney. with a minimum combined single limit of $500.000.00 aggrecate for

any one occurrence on any job for which a permit is required under this code, provided the

Citv of Lincoln shall be named an additional insured thereunder. The coverages required

herein shall be subject to review and approval by the City Attorney for conformance with

the provisions of this seclion.

18



—_

(b) At all times. keep on file with the Department of Building and Safety a current certificate

2 of insurance signed by a gualitied agent of an insurance company licensed to do business
3 in the State of Nebraska and approved by the City Attorney for conformance with the
4 provisions of this section evidencing the existence of valid and elfeclive polictes of
5 insurance naming the city as an additional insured for the coverage required by subsection
6 (a) of this section, the limits of each policy. the policy number. the name of the insurer, the
7 effective date and cxpiration datc of each policy. the deductibles or self-insurance retainers
3 of each policy. and a copy ol an endorsement placed on each policy requiring thirty (30)
9 days’ notice by mail to the Department of Building and Safety before the insurer may
10 cancel the policy for anv reason. and upon request of the Department of Building and
11 Safety or the City Atlorney. a copy of anv endorsements placed on such policies or the
12 declarations page of such policies.

13 Expiration or_cancellation of anv insurance coverage required by this section shall
14 constitute an aulomalic and immediate lermination of the fire suppression svstem
15 contractor’s privilege to be issued permits under the provisions of this code. unless other
16 insurance meeting the requirements of this section is provided and in full force and effect
17 at the time of such expiration or canceilation.

18 Section 20. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by

19  adding a new section numbered 19.03.106 to read as follows:

20 19.03.106 _ Section 105.9 Added; Payment Bond.

21 Section 105.9 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:

22 105.9 Payvment Bond. Before any master plumber or licensed fire suppression system

23 contractor may be issued a permit to make excavations in the public ways of the ¢ily. such master

19



plumber or licensed fire suppression svstem contraclor shall deposii with the Department of

Building and Safety a $5,000.00 paviment bond. Said bond shall provide that the master plumber

or fire suppression sysiem contractor shall pav to the City of Lincoln the cost of refilling such

excavation and replacing the surface thereof.

Section 21. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.108 to read as follows:

19.03.108 Section 106.2 Amended; Schedule of Permii Fees.

Seclion 106.2 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

106.2 Schedule of Permit Fees. The following shall be the permit fees charged for the

permits required by the International Fire Code Sections 105.6 and 105.7, and this code.

L | Camivals. Fairs. Festivals 1814000 |
) 2. l_E}_aploswes and Blasting Agents (IFC Chapter 56) $165.00 annually
( 3.t Fireworks Display {IFC Chapter 56 and LMC Chapter 9.44) o . - $20 6 00 o
4, | Firework Sramd (IFC Chapter 56 and LMC Chapter 944) AAAAAA $165.00 o
- Firework Stand LATE FEE (after 6/10) $50.00 late fee ‘
5. ' IFlammable Combustible Liguids Tank [nstallation (IFL (haptert; 23 and 57) $100.00 per tank |
%777-77*—7 ank Closures - - ] 31—&)'00}&*";{;; i
: o i Replace-ment P['_C-)-d-;l;t Lme S - _ _$50.00 per linc
! 6. | Hazardous Materials (IFC Table 105.6.20)
? - LESS than exempt amount $115.00 annually
] - MORE than exempt amount $200.00 annually
;I 7. | Storage and Use Liquefied Petroleum Gas (IFC Chapter 61) 7 $95.00 o
SL 8. | Assembly (P'OA) (IFC Chapter 202)
- 50 to 299 occupants $115.00 annually
- 300 to 999 occupants $140.00 annually
- __ 1000 or more occupants $165.00 annually !

20



Residential and Non-Residential

() beds

Pvrotechmc / Specml l:ffect M‘lterlal (IFC (,]ilptEI 36) 3125 00
10. WWW $100.00 annually
‘  Storage of Scrap Tires and Tire Byproducts that Exceed 2.500 Cubic Feet (IFC
AL Chavter 34 $£100.00 annually :
i 12. TemporarLMembralr;c_ S"t;'l;cture T;t or Canomes (IFC 105.7.25) $125.00
_12;1. Temporary Membrane Strugture, Tents or Canopies used as Assembly (see IFC | T
T 1 0 - N
- 1to 30 days erected $125.00
- 31 to 60 days creclcd_ N - $175.00
- - 61 to t B0 days erected | $225.00
: Applications for a temporary membrane structure. tent, or canopy must be
subtnitted at least five (5) davs BEFORE it is erected. or a LATE FEE will be $50.00 late fee I
charged. |
13. | Maobile Food Preparation Vehicles (IFC Section 3.19) $80.00 annually
—;_4—; .-f:l;Mtels and Qg)tels !
b -E_ZOIOZI’IL‘: - o o 77771 $100.00 aliln:;ilyﬂ
. - 41 to 120 rooms ) S - a $l"5 OO dnnually
| ” - 1" { to 200 IjOI)I]]S o o ) $165.00 annuall\"
f o 201 or more roorr{é—__ N _ i ‘ ‘| $190 00 annualh |
i 15. | Fraternities and Sororities - -
| - - 1to 40 rooms $100.00 annually
i - 41 or more rooms $125.00 annuallv
71_6', l [nstitutional Group I-4 (Child and Adult Davcane Facilities) (IFC Chdi;e—r—"ﬂil) ) —"'“—"—"— B
i - 1to 8 persons $60.00 ‘
o —_ u&ﬁ} 12.|;érsons - $70.00 !
o 7 7 - 13 or more persons - $80_E(; - 1
'rl -ii 7 gCIIODIS (LMC Section 27.02.200) $150.00 annually
" g Health Care Facilities (LMC Section 27.02.090) R

|
" &1 lS OO dnnuallv ,

—_

- 1to 50 beds

21

$14O 00 annuallv i




- 51 to 100 beds $165.00 annually
| . i0lormorebeds 7 - | $190.00 annually
'19. | Liquoc Bsteblishmients |

- Non-¢onsumption establishments $115.00

- Consumption establishments 140.00
,v 20. | Mobile Home Court (LMC Section 21.56.010) o 7 7 o
| . 11025 mobilehomes ' $115.00 anaually |

- 26_t0 50 mabile homes $140.00 annually
o - 51 or more mobile homes : | $1(:5.00 anﬁ&ﬂl?ﬂ

21. | High Rise Buildings (IFC Chapter 202} - sTZE.Bd:nnual]\/_
l __!_]_nstitutional Group 1-3 (1FC Chapter 202)
22. | - Including, but not limited to, Correctional Centers, Detention Centers,
o Prerelease Centers. Jails, Prisons, and Reformatories. - i
- {beds $115.00 annually
". lwsobkeds 7T ) o | $140.00 annually |
l T 5110 100 beds $165.00 annually
‘ - 10l ormorebeds ﬁ $190.00 annual'[; '
E—& Ceftiﬁéation of Compliance {(COC) (LMC Section 5.38.065) o $65.00 )
24 | Fire Alarm Systems
. L t073[) devices - o $?)0707{;#7ﬁ ﬁ j
I 51 60 deviees - _ Usioon

- 611090 devices o $160.00 }
- 77#71}7}?}1?);; gvices o $190.00 i
1 Fire Suppression System - Fire Sprinkler Systems _ o

— gij;aitnz ﬁ:? ;0 izz:iasCZtigggi\iglsli Id-:f::lf::‘:z)the sq. ft. coverage) 37500

- Upto 5,000 sq. fi. in coverage 75.00

- Each additional 5,000 sq. ft. or fraction thereof up to 50.000 sq. ft. $50.00

- Each additional 5,000 sq. ft. or fraction thereof over 50.000 sq. ft. 15.00

26. | Fire Suppression System - Underground Piping $75.00

22



10

27. | Fire Suppression SVStem - Standpipe Systems $35.00

| Fire Suppression System - Wet/Dry Chemical Systems and Gas Extinguishing

28. $80.00
Svstems
29, | Fire Suppression System — New or Replacement Backflow Preventer Device $35.00
. Reinspection ee
- Examples include. but are not limited to, wrong address. equipment that | 4 Permit Fee
30. does not pass inspection. incomplele work, inaccessible equipment.

suppression systems. fire alarms. and any violations that are required to be  $40.00 Min.

' corrected after the initial inspection.

i Late Fee — Operational Permits ({IFC 105.6.51)
S 3L - It the gperational permit fee 1s not paid prior to January 1%, a late fee will  $75.00
| be assessed for the renewal vear, !

| Refunds - Construction Permits (IFC 105.1.2(2N
- Permit holders returning the unused conslruction permit _prior lo the
| expiration date of the permit (IFC 105.3.1). shail be limited to 2 maximum

refund amounting to two-thirds of the original fee if the original fee was
32 $75.00 or more.

$25.00 processing fee will be levied and the remaining fee amount will be

|
I . . ..

| - For construction permits, where the original fee was less than $75.00. a
|

refunded to the permit holder.

Section 22. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.109 to read as follows:

19.03.10Y Section 106.3 Amended; Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance.

Section 106.3 of the International Fire Code 1s amended 1o read as follows:

106.3 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance, A person. firm. corporation. or

partnership who commences any work, activity or operation regulated by this code before

obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to a doubled permit fee. which shall be in addition

to the required permit {ee. Payment of such doubled lees shall not relieve any person. irm

corporation, or partnership from fully complving with the reguirements of this code in the

execution of the work or anv other penalties prescribed herein.

23




10

11

12

13

14

15

16

18

19

20

21

22

23

Section 23. That Section 19.03.110 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to

read as follows:

19.03.110 Section 107.2.1 Amended186-5-Added; Inspection Requests.

Section 107.2.14863 of the International Fire Code is amended added-to read as follows:
107.2.1186-5 Inspection Requests. If the person doing the work requests that an

inspection be conducted on a holiday or weekend, said person shall pay a fee equal to the actual

costs to the City for the-perfermranee-of-the inspection conducted by the fire code officialby-the
HSPECLOF.

It shall be the duty of the person doing the work, authorized by a permit, to notify the fire
code official that such work is ready for inspection. The fire code official is authorized to require
that every request for inspection be filed not less than one (1) working day before such inspection

is desired. Such requests may be in writing, -e£-by telephone. through text message, or through

the automated process set forth by the Department of Building and Satetv-atthe-option-efthe-code

offieial.
It shall be the duty of the person requesting any required inspections to provide access to
and means for proper inspection of such work.
Section 24. That Section 19.03.120 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to
read as follows:
19.03.120 Section 1098 Amended; Board of Appeals.

Section 1098 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

Seetion-1098.1 Board of Appeals Created. ¢arBeerd-ef-Appeals-Created—In order to

hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions, and determinations made by the fire code official

relative to the application and interpretation of this code, including but not limited to the suitability

24



10

11

12

13

14

16

17

18

20

21

22

ol alternale materials and type of construction, there shall be and hereby is created a BBoard of
aAppeals, consisting of five (3) members who arc qualified by experience and training to pass on
pertinent matters. The fire code official shall be an ex officio member and shall act as secretary
of the board but shall have no vote on any matter before the board. The bBoard of aAppeals shall
be appointed by the mMayor and shall serve staggered terms of three (3) years. The bBoard of
Appeals shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its investigation and shall
render all decisions and findings in writing to the fire code official with a duplicate copy to the
appellant and may recommend to the eCity eCouncil such new legislation as is consistent
therewith.

109.2 b)——Appeals to Board. Any person who is aggrieved by any order, decision,
or determination of the fire code official relating to the application or interpretation of any
provisions of this code or to the suitability of alternate materials or methods of construction, may
appeal such decision by filing an appeal. on forms furnished by the {ire code official. within thirty
(30) days from the date of such decision. The filing of a completed appeals form, along with the
payment of the prescribed fee, shall be sufficient for the purpose of commencing an appeal
proceeding hereunder.

104.3 ¢e9——Filing Fees. The fee for each appeal filed with the fire code official shall
be as follows:

(1) $250.00 filing fee for review of a decision of the fire code official involving
an interpretation of any provisions of this code;
(2) $250.00 filing fee for review of a decision of the fire code official relating

to the suitability of alternate materials or methods of construction.

25



[0

11

12

13

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

109.4 {&——Hearing Date. The fire code official shall refer all properly and timely filed
appeals to the bBoard of eAppeals for hearing. The secretary of said board shall in each appeal
notify the appellant in writing of the date, time, and place of hearing before the board, which date
shall be no later than thirty (30) days from the filing of the appeal. Such notice shall be served
upon the applicant by personal service or registered mail.

109.5 {e}——Hearing Procedure. Hearings on appeal need not be conducted according
to technical rules relating to evidence and witnesses. Oral evidence shall be taken only on oath or
affirmation. Any relevant evidence shall be admitted if it is the type of evidence upon which
responsible persons are accustomed to rely in the conduct of serious affairs, regardless of the
existence of any common law or statutory rule which may make improper the admission of such
evidence over objection in civil actions in courts of competent jurisdiction in this state. Irrelevant
and unduly repetitious evidence shall be excluded. The appellant, the fire code official, and any
other party to an appeal hereunder shall have these rights, among others:

(1) To call and examine witnesses on any matter relevant to the issues of the
hearing;

(2) To introduce documentary and physical evidence;

(3) To cross-examine opposing witnesses on any matter relevant to the issues
of the hearing; and

(4) To rebut the evidence against him or her.

109.6 &———Decision of Board. The bBoard of aAppeals shall, within fifteen (15) days
after the hearing, render a written decision which shall state its findings and conclusions.

Decisions of the board may be appealed as provided by law.

26



10

11

13

14

I5

16

17

18

20

21

22

23

109.7 {g»——FEnforcement. Enforcement of any decision, notice, or order of the fire
code official issued under this code shall be stayed during the pendency of an appeal therefrom
which is properly and timely filed, except in cases of emergency, where enforcement of the same
is necessary for the protection of life, limb, or property.

Section 25. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.122 to read as follows:

19.03.122  Section 114 Added; Qualifications, Examination, and Registration of a Fire

Suppression System Contractor, Journeyman, or Apprentice.

Sectlion |14 of the International Fire Code is added to rcad as follows:

114.1 Qualifications. The fire code official shall delermine the minimum qualifications

for applicants who wish to register as a licensed fire suppression system contractor. a licensed

journevman. or an apprentice: and shall approve the form and content of any ¢xamination to be

oiven to the applicants.

114.1.1 Fire Suppression System Contractor. To be elivible to revister as a Licensed

fire suppression system contracior. the applicant shall first be a licensed fire suppression

system journevman, currently regisiered through the Department of Building and Safety.

for at least one (1) vear; or shall be a mechanical engineer graduate from an accredited

college or university. have at least two (2) yvears of practical experience in the planming.

layout. supervising and installing of fire suppression equipment. and shall be a registered

professional mechanical engineer in the State of Nebraska or (INICET) National Institute

for Certification in Eneineering Technologies Level 3 or 4.
for Certificat E Technol Level 3 or 4

An applicant holding a valid fire suppression system contractor’s license. received by

another state or municipal covernmental agenev. shall be entitled to take the equivalent

27



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

respeclive fire suppression svstem contractor examination. established by the City of

Lincoln, without submitting anv additional qualifications.

114.1.2 Fire Suppression System Journeyman. To be eligible to register as a licensed

fire suppression syslem jourmeyman. the applicant shall have at least four (4) vears of

practical experience, as a registered fire suppression system apprentice, in the design,

lavout, construction and/or installation of fire suppression svstems, materials, and

equipment.

An applicant, while regularly employed by a person, tirm or corporation regularly

engaged in the installation of fire suppression systems. shall receive one (1) vear practical

experience credit for each vear of full-time employment. The practical experience

credited for part-time fire suppression installations shall be determined by the fire code

olficial.

An applicant. graduating from a four (4) vear engineering course from an accredited

collese or university will receive two (2) vears of practical experience credit required

above.

An applicant. completing a course of study approved by the fire code official. in the

desien. construction and installation of fire suppression systems will receive one (1) vear

of practical experience credit required above.

A professional mechanical engineer registered in the Stalc of Nebraska. will receive three

{3) vears ol practical experience credit required above.

Fire suppression education and training received from military service. exlension courses.

adult education classes, etc., mayv account for practical experience credit at the discretion

of the fire codc official.

28



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

An applicant holding a valid fire suppression system journevman’s license, received by

another state or municipal govermmental agency. shall be entitled to take the equivalent

respective fire suppression system journeyman examination. established by the City of

Lincoln. without submitting anv additional qualifications.

114.1.3 Fire Suppression System Apprentice. No Requircment.

114.2 Examination. Before an applicant can make applicatlion to register as a licensed

lire suppression system contractor or a licensed fire suppression system journeyman, per section

114.3.2 of this code, the applicant shall submit to the respective examination sct forth by the City

of Lincoln’s designated testing agency, Information pertaining to the designated tlesling agency

can be found through the Department of Buildine and Safety’s website at htips:/lincoln.ne.gov/.

Applicants shall be held responsible to schedule their own respective examinations througeh the

designated testing asencv., Once the respective examination has been passed. the applicant shall

submit the proper credentials through the processes set forth by the Department of Building and

Safetv to become registered per seclion 114.3 of this code.

114.2.1 Schedule of Examination Fees. All examinations are subject to an examination

fee set forth by the desipnated testing agency.

114.3 Registration. No person shall engage in the business of designing. planning,

supervising. altering, modifving, repairing, inspecting or testing of a tire suppression syslem. nor

enegaee in contracting for such work, without first havine been registered as a licensed fire

suppression system contractor under the provisions of this code.

Emplovees of the fire suppression system contractor may perform work on behalf of the fire

suppression svstem contracior under the following conditions:

29



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

a. A licensed fire suppression svstem journeyman shall be permitted to install. alter.

repair, inspecl. or lest a respective fire suppression system on behalf of the licensed

fire suppression system contractor.

b. A receistered fire suppression system apprentice shall be permitted o assist in the

insiallation. alteration. repair. inspection, or testing of a respective fire suppression

system, under the direct supervision and in the immediate presence of a licensed fire

suppression system journevman. on behalf of the licensed fire suppression system

contractor.

Registration under this code does not authorize the installation, repair, or alteration of

plumbing or drainage for which a plumber's registration 1s required under this code.

114.3.1 Registration of Corporations, Firms, Partnerships, or Limited Liability

Companies (LLC). Any corporation. fimm. partnership. or LLC may be registered

hereunder as a fire suppression system contractor in the name of such comporation, firm,

partnership. or LLC; provided. that such corporation. firm, partnership. or LLC shall have

a licensed fire suppression syslem contraclor who has met the minimum qualifications and

submitted to the respective examination given by the fire code official. and is an officer

or manager of such corporation, firm, partnership. or LLC who shall, at all times. be in

actual charge of and be responsible for the installation or repair of any and all firc

suppression system work done by such corporation. firm. partnership. or LLC.

If after corporation, firm. partnership, or LLC has been registered, the fire suppression

svslem contractor, as an officer or manager of the corporation, firm, partnership, or LLC,

shall withdraw therelrom and cease to be connected therewith. then and in that cvent the

registration of such corporation, firm. parinership, or LI.C shall be revoked. A fire

30



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

suppression system contractor working tor and covered by the insurance of a corporation,

firm, partnership. or LL.C registered under this section is not required to duplicate such

coverace under their own insurance policy.

114.3.2 Application. Before an applicant can be redistered as a licensed fire suppression

svstem contractor. a licensed fire suppression system journevinan, or an apprentice, the

applicant shall apply for the respective license and/or registration through the processes

sel forth by the Depariment of Building and Safety. All applicants shall obtain the

required registration information through the Department of Building and Safetv’s

website at htips://lincoln.ne.gov/,

114.3.3 Schedule of Registration Fees. Before an applicant can be registered as a

licensed fire suppression system contractor. a licensed fire suppression sysiem

joumeyman, or an apprentice. a registration fee, set forth in this code. shall be paid. Such

fees shall be paid to the Department of Building and Safety. No registration fee shall be

refunded.

"L Sprinkler System Contractor Registration Fee $135.00 annually |
{—2_.__-S_|;ri—nk_ler System Journeyman Registration Fee $40.00 annually

; 3. WetDry Chemical System Contractor chistra;iﬁciei . $135.00 annually
Fi Wet/Dry Chemical System Joumeyman Registration Fee o $q40_00—;1n;1;11&_
‘ 5, | Gas Extinguishing Svstem Contractor Registration Fee - $135.00 annually
:61 B LE}’as Extinguishing System Journeyman Registratioﬁ Fee $40.00 allnu;Ily

; - Sprinkler System Apprentice, Wet/dry Chemical System Apprentice. or Gas

; L . ; ) ) $40.00 anpually
Extinguishing Svstem Apprentice Registralion Fee j

114.3.4 Final Review. Once the applicant has met all the minimum qualifications. passed

the respective examinations, and registered witl the Citv of Lincoln under the provisions

31



10

i

12

i3

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

of this code. the {ire code official shall have the authority to conduct a final review. Upon

the final review by the fire code official, the applicant will receive notification that he or

she has passed all criteria set forth by the City of Lincoln 1o become a licensed fire

suppression system contractor. a licensed fire suppression systen jOUmMevIman, or an

apprentice.  All necessary documentation will be available online for the applicant to

download and print at their own convenience.

114.3.5 Suspension or Revocation of License. The fire code official shall have the

power Lo suspend or revoke any fire suppression system contractor, journeyman, of

apprentice license and/or registration i1f the same was obtained by error or fraud. or if the

holder thereof is shown to be no longer qualified. or if such holder fails. neglects, or

refuses to comply with the provisions of this code.

114.3.6 Renewal of License. Registrations at the sime of their ex iration. ma pbe

renewed upon approval by the fire code official and upon pavment of the required annual

registration fee as indicated by this code.

114.3.7 Expired or Lapsed License. All fire suppression system contractor or

journeyman licenses shall expire on the thirty-first (31*) dav of May.

Any person, registered under the provisions of this code as a licensed fire suppression

system contractor or journeyman who does nol renew their registration lor a period of

sixty (60) days alter the expiration date. shall be required to retake the respective

examination as required by this code.

Section 26. That Section 19.03.125 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to

read as follows:

19.03.125 Section 202 Amended;-General Definitions.

32



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Section 202 of the International Fire Code is amended to add the following definitions:

FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS. An all-inclusive term to capture the three (3) different types

of fire suppression systems. The term fire suppression systems shall be subcategonzed under one

the followinge svstems:

Sprinkler Syvstem. Including but not limited to. automatic sprinkler systems. automatic

manual spray or deluge svstems. special fixed pipine fire control systems using water. and

standpipe systems. For the purpose of this code, standpipe systems shall mean a wet or

dry system of piping. valves. outlets and related equipment designed to provide water at

specified pressures and installed exclusively for the extinguishment of a fire,

Wet/Drv Chemical System. Includine but not limited to. special fire extinguishing

systems using fpam or dry chemicals or both for ihe control or the extinguishment ol a

fire.

Gas Extinguishing Svstem. Including but not limited to, special fire extinguishing

svstems using inerl gases for the control or the extinguishment of a fire.

FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM APPRENTICE., A person, other than a fire suppression

system contractor or journcyman, who is enpaged in leaming and assistine in the installation,

alteration, repair. inspeclion and tesling of a (ire suppression system as an emplovee under the

direct supervision and in the immediate presence of a fire suppression system contractor or

journevman and who can meet all the required qualifications established by this code.

FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM CONTRACTOR. Anv person who holds themselves out as

skilled in designing. planning, and supervisine in the installation. alteration, modification. repair,

inspection and testing of a fire suppression system and who can meet all the required qualifications

established by this code. The fire suppression system contractor shall be envaged in contracting

33



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

20

21

22

23

for such work with full responsibility of supervision. whether doing such work themselves or

emploving fire suppression system journeymen or apprentice for assistance.

The term fire suppression systcm contractor shall be subcateporized under one the following

contractors:

Sprinkler System Contractor. Sece I'ire Suppression Systems. Sprinkler System to

determine the scope of work limited a sprinkler svstem contractor.

Wet/Dry Chemical System Contractor. See Fire Suppression Systems:; Wet/Drv

Chemical Svstem to determine the scope of work limited a wet/dry chemical system

contractor.

(Gas Extinguishing System Contractor. See Fire Suppression  Svstems: Gas

Extinguishing Svystem to determine the scope of work limited a gas extinguishing svstem

contraclor.

FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM JOURNEYMAN. Any person emploved by a fire suppression

system contractor. other than a fire suppression system apprentice, who is engaged in the install-

ation. alteration. repair, 1nspection and testing of a fire suppression system. and the supcrvision

thereof, and who can meet all the required gualifications established by this code.

The term fire suppression system journeyman shall be subcategorized under one the following

contractors:

Sprinkler System Journevman. See Fire Suppression Svstems:; Sprinkler Svstem Lo

determine the scope of work Jumited a sprinkler system journevman.

Wet/Drv_Chemical Svstem Journevman. See Fire Suppression Svstems:; Wet/Dry

Chemical Svstem to determine the scope of work limited a wet/dry chemical system

oumecyman.

34



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

Gas Extinguishing Svstem Journevman, See Fire Suppression Svstems: (Gas

Extinguishing System 1o determine the scope ol work limited a gas extinguishing system

journeyinan,

JURISDICTION. Whenever the word jurisdiction is used in the International Fire Code (IFC),

it shall be held to mean the jurnisdiction of the City ol Lincoln. Nebraska.

Section 27. That Section 19.03.131 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to

read as follows:

19.063.131 Section 307.3 Amendedé-Added; Extinguishment Authority.
Section 307.36-4s-addedte of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:
307.36 Extinguishment Authority. WhesWhere open buming, recreational fires, or

outdoor fireplaces creates or adds to a hazardous situation, or a required permit for open burning

has not been obtained, the fire code official or the fire department is authorized to order the

extinguishment of the fire.

Section 28. That Section 19.03.133 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be and the same

is hereby repealed:

Section 29. That Section 19.03.140 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended to

read as follows:

35



11

12

13

14

15

17

18

19

20

2]

22

19.03.140 Section 506.1 Amended; Key Boxes: Where Required Seetion—903.4.1

Section 506.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

506.1 Key Boxes; Where Required. Where access to or within a structurc or an arca is

restricted because of secured openings or where immediate access 1s necessary tor life-safely or

fire-fightine. purposes. a key box shall be required and installed in an approved location as

determined by LLFR or the lire code olficial. The kev box shall be an approved tvpe listed in

accordance with UL 1037, and shall contain kevs to eain necessary access as required by LFR.

36



10

11

12

13

i4

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

Section 30. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.150 to read as follows:

19.03.150 Section 901.2.1 Amended:; Statement of Compliance.

Section 801.2.1 of the International Fire Code is amended o read as lollows:

901.2.1 Statement of Compliance. Before requesting final approval of the installation,

where required by the [ire code official. the installing contractor shall furnish a written statement

to the fire code official that the subject fire protection svsteni has been installed in accordance with

the city-approved construction documents and has been tested in accordance with the

manufacturer’s  specification. the approprate installation standards. and with the applicable

provisions of Titles 17, 19, and 20 of the Lincoln Municipal Code or any of the rules and

rceulations promulgated pursuant thereto. Anv deviations from the design standards shall be noted

and copies of the approvals for such deviation shall be attached to the wrilten stalement.

Section 31. That Section 19.03.160 of the Lincoln Municipal Code is hereby
renumbered to Section 19.03.220 and the existing Section 19.03.160 is hereby amended to read as

follows:

19.03.160 Section 901.4.7 Added; Fire Suppression Svstem Extension.

Section 901.4.7 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:

901.4.7 Fire Suppression System Extension. All equipment. appliances. and accessories

to each fire suppression svstem shall be confined within the building or on the premises specilied

in the application for such svstem. and no fire suppression system shall be extended into any other

building or upon any other premises than those specified in the application, uniess special

permission is obtained from the fire code official. The fire code official shall srant no permit for

the extension of anv fire suppression svstem into any building or upon any premises other than

37



10

11

12

13

14

15

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

specified in the application, unless construction documents and specifications thereof have been

furmished as provided in this code.

Section 32. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.170 to read as follows:

19.03.170 Section 901.5.2 Added; Fire Suppression Svstem Acceptance Testing.

Section 901.5.2 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:

9MH.5.2 Fire Suppression System Acceptance Testing. Each fire suppression svstem

shall be tested by the appropriate fire suppression system contractor or journeyvman as specified in

this code. A Statement of Compliance of cach fire suppression system test shall be filed with the

Department of Building and Safety.

Section 33. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.180 to read as follows:

19.03.180 Section 903.3.1.1.3 Added; Post Indicator Valve Location.

Section 903.3.1.1.3 of the International Fire Code is added to read as follows:

903.3.1.1.3 Post Indicator Valve Location. Where post indicator valves, serving an NIFPA 13

system. cannot be located not less than 40 leet [rom the building it serves. it shall be permitted to

be located closer where approved by the fire code official,

Section 34. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.190 to read as follows:

19.03.190 Section 903.3.5.3 Added: Installation of Underground Piping.

Section 903.3.5.3 of the Intermnational Fire Code is added to read as follows:

903.3.5.3 Installation of Underground Piping. The installation of underground piping can be

performed by either a master plumber or a licensed fire suppression system contractor, registered

38



10

11

12

13

14

IS

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

under the provisions of this code. The underground pipine commences where the line connects to

the tapping sleceve and valve on the city's water main and extends to the point where the line

connects o the double-check back (low preventer inside the buillding or premises.

Section 35. That Section 19.03.145 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be renumbered
to Section 19.03.200 and be amended to read as follows:
19.03.200445 Section 1004.311 Exception Deleted; Areas Without Fixed Seating.
The exception to Section 1004.54-+ of the International Fire Code is hereby deleted.
Section 36. That Section 19.03.147 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be renumbered
10 Section 19.03.210 and be amended to read as follows:
19.03.210447 Section 10164.2.1 Exception Deleted; Exit Access; Multiple Tenants.
The exception to Section 10164.2.1 of the International Fire Code is hereby deleted.
Section 37. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.212 to read as follows:

19.03.212 Section 3103.6 Amended; Construction Documents.

Section 3103.6 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

3103.6 Construction Documents. A detailed site and tloor plan for tents or membrane

structures shall be provided with each application for approval. The tent or membrane structure

loor plan shall indicate delails of the means of ecress facilities. seating. capacity. arrangement of

the seating and location and type of heating ad clectrical equipment. The construction documents

shall include an analvsis of structural stability.

Section 38. That Section 19.03.220 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be renumbered
to Section 19.03.230 and the existing Section 19.03.220 be amended to read as follows:

19.03.22(160 Section 3063301.1 Amended; Explosives and Fireworks.

39



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

20

21

22

23

Section 563301.1 of the Intemational Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

563301.1 Explosives and Fireworks. The provisions of this chapter and the LMC

Chapter 9.44 oftheLinecolnMunieipal-Cede-shall govern the possession, manufacture, storage,

handling, sale and use of explosives, explosive matenial, fireworks, and small arms ammunition.

Exceptions:

1. The Armed Forces of the United States, Coast Guard or National Guard.

2. Explosives in forms prescribed by the official United States Pharmacopoeia.

3. The possession, storage and use of small arms ammunition when packaged in

accordance with DOTn packaging requirements.

4, The possession, storage and use of not more than one pound (0.454 kg) of
commercially manufactured sporting black powder, 20 pounds (9 kg) of smokeless powder and
10,000 small arms primers for hand loading of small arms ammunition for personal consumption.

5. The use of explosive materials by federal, state and local regulatory, law
enforcement, and fire agencies acting in their official capacities.

6. Special industrial explosive devices which in the aggregate contain less than 50
pounds (23 kg) of explosive materials.

7. The possession, storage, and use of blank industrial-power load cartridges when
packaged 1n accordance with DOTn packaging regulations.

8. Transportation in accordance with DOTn 49 CFR Parts 100-185478.

9. [tems pre-emptedprepared by federal regulations.

Section 39. That Section 19.03.220 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be renumbered
to Section 19.03.230 and amending Section 19.03.230 as currently existing to read as follows:

19.03.23028 Copies Filed with City Clerk Additional Definitions.

40



10

11

12

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

Not less than one copy of said "International Fire Code" referred to in Section 19.03.010,
together with such amendments thereto as may be made from time to time, shall be filed for use
and examination by the public in the office of the City Clerk. Three printed copies of each said

publication shall be kept in the office of the Department of Building and Safety for use and

examination by the public.

Section 40. That Section 19.03.225 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be renumbered
to Section 19.03.240 and amended to read as follows:
19.03.24025 Fire Code Task Foree; Created.

There is hereby created the Fire Code Task Force which shall advise the Mayor of the
suitability of alternate equipment, materials and methods of installation and reasonable
interpretations of this code; review and recommend changes to this code; and provide such other
advisory duties related to this code as may be deemed necessary by the Mayor. Appointments
shall be made by the Mayor and shall run for three (3) years each and all terms shall run concurrent
with each other. Appointments for vacancies shall run only for the unexpired term. The Mayor
may reappoint members as may be deemed appropriate and the Mayor may remove a member at
any time. Each member shall serve without pay. Selection of officers, times and places for
meetings, and other rules and procedures shall be as directed by the Mayor and set forth in an

executrve order.

41



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

22

23

Section 41. That Section 19.03.250 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be renumbered
to a new section numbered 19.03.280 and the existing Section 19.03.250 is hereby amended to

read as follows:

19.03.250 Fire Code Task Force; Members; Selection Process.

The Fire Code Task Force shall consist of the fire code ofticial {chairperson). additional

representatives of the Bureau of Fire Prevention as requested by the fire code official. an architect.

a commercial general coniractor, a sprinkler system contractor. a wet/dry chemnical system

contractor. a pas extinguisher system contractor. a licensed mechanical engineer. and the Chief

Plumbing Inspector {or the City of Lincoln. One person may represent more than one of the

positions on the Fire Code Task Force.

Section 42. That Chapter 19.03 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be amended by
adding a new section numbered 19.03.260 to read as follows:

19.03.260 Fire Code Task Force: Request for Meeting,

The Fire Code Task Force shall meet when deemed necessary at the request of the fire code

official (chairperspn). All meetings shall be open to the public and minutes shall be kept by the

Department of Building and Safety.

Section 43. That Section 19.03.240 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be renumbered
to Section 19.03.270 to read as follows:
19.03.27040 Penalty.
Any person firm, or corporation who shall violate any of the provisions of this code hereby
adopted, or fail to comply therewith, or who shall violate or fail to comply with any order made
thereunder shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and upon conviction thereof shall be fined in

any sum not to exceed $500.00 or imprisonment in the county jail for a period not to exceed six

4



20

2l

22

23

months or both, except that each person so convicted shall be fined in a sum of not less than
$200.00 for the first offense, not less than $250.00 for the second offense, and not less than $300.00
for the third offense and each offense thereafter. FEach day that a violation continues shall
constitute a separate and distinct offense and shall be punishable as such.

Section 44. That Section 19.03.250 of the Lincoln Municipal Code be renumbered
to Section 19.03.280 to read as follows:
19.03.2850  Severability.

The unconstitutionality of any part or parts of this chapter shall not affect the other parts.

If for any reasons any section or part or parts of any section or sections of this chapter shall be
declared unconstitutional or beyond the power of the city to enact, such facts shall not affect or
impair in any way other provisions of this chapter, but such other provisions shall be in full force
and effect.

Section 45. That Sections 19.03.010, 19.03.030, 19.03.040, 19.03.050, 19.03.060,
19.03.070, 19.03.080, 19.03.090, 19.03.100, 19.03.110, 19.03.120, 19.03.125, 19.03.131,
19.03.140, 19.03.145, 19.03.147, 19.03.160, 19.03.220, 19.03.225, 19.03.230, 19.03.240, and
19.03.250 of the Lincoln Municipal Code as hitherto existing be and the same are hereby repealed.

Section 46. This ordinance shall go into force and effect on January 3, 2022.

Section 47. This ordinance shall be published, within fifteen days after the passage
hereof, in one issue of a daily or weekly newspaper of general circulation in the City, or posted on
the official bulletin board of the City, located on the wall across from the City Clerk’s office at
555 S. 10th Street, in lieu and in place of the foregoing newspaper publication with notice of
passage and such posting to be given by publication one time in the official newspaper by the City

Clerk. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and afier its passage and publication

43



1 orafteri i 1 ' ing gi
er its posting and notice of such posting given by publication as herein and in the City Charter

2 provided.

Introduced by:

%ﬂa acfon-$0

AYES: Beckius, Bowers, Meginnis, Raybould,
Shobe, Ward, Washington; NAYS: None,

Approved as to Form & Legality:

PASSED Approved this % dayof _S,ptc ,2021:
AUG 2 3 2021
BY CITY COUNCIL

44



ORDINANCE NO. _21116

AN'ORDINANCE: Amending Lincoln Municipal Code Chapter.19.03, Lincoln Fire Code, to adopt the
2018 edition of the International Fire Code, as amended, as part of the Lincoln Fire Code.

Read First Time August 9, 2021
Read Second Time  August 16, 2021
Read Third Time August 23, 2021

Passed August 23, 2021

Published in Lincoln Journal Star

on September 3, 2021

CERTIFICATE
State of Nebraska )
) ss
County of Lancaster )

[, the undersigned, City Clerk of the City of Lincoln, Nebraska, do hereby certify that the within
ordinance is the original Ordinance No. _21116 as passed by the City Council of said City, as
indicated above, and as approved by the Mayor of said City and as the same appears of record in my
office and is now in my charge remaining as Interim City Clerk aforesaid.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, 1 have hereunto set my hand officially and affixed the seal of the
City of Lincoln, Nebraska this _23% day of __August _, 2021.




